RNT No. KARBIL/2001/47147

CVJ & (&
QO

©RFITON TFTITOVTT

DIes 08y &3S

a3 IV-Al Fotusedh, Aeeshaes, 83020 985, 0N (&F 02, I3 Jx@E NFA2) wo. N2x2
Part- IV-A Bengaluru, Monday, December 28, 2015 (Pushya 07, Shaka Varsha 1937) No. 1757

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
No. SAMVYASHAE 50 SHASANA 2015, Bengaluru, dated: 28.12.2015.

Ordered that the translation of 3Toress 03N (FPog) (3TB) LOch, 2015 (20158 smoread
vIcha Fo5;43) in the English language, be published as authorised by the Governor of Karnataka
under clause (3) of Article 348 of the constitution of India in the Karnataka Gazette for general
information.

The following translation of goorud §ywdind (o) (33yTa) ©OI0DZD, 2015 (20158 3ToF i
©oRohs Ko:5:43) in the English language is published in the Official Gazette under the authority of
the Governor of Kamataka under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India shall be
deemed to be the authoritative text thereof in English language.

EARNATAEKA ACT NO 43 OF 2015

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the
Twenty eighth day of December, 2015)

THE KARNATAEKA INDUSTRIES (FACILITATION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2015
(Received the assent of the Governor on the Twenty third day of December, 2015)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Industries (facilitation) Act, 2002.

Whereas it is expedient to amend the Karnataka Industries (facilitation) Act, 2002
(Karnataka Act 45 of 2003) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Kamataka State Legislature in the Sixty-sixth year of the Republic of
India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Kamataka Industries
(Facilitation) (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) Tt shall come into force at once. ) f

-

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Kamataka Industries (Facilitation) Act, 2002
(Karnataka Act 45 of 2003) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,) in section 3,-

(i) in sub-section (1), after the words "State High Level Clearance Committee” the words
under the chairmanship of the Chief Minister” shall be inserted: and

(ii) in sub-section (2], for the words "one hundred crores” the words "five hundred crores”
shall be substituted.

LN
s



2

3. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act -

(i) in sub-section (1), after the words "State Level Single Window Clearance Committee" Luegay

words “under the chairmanship of the Minister incharge of major and medium >
industries" shall be inserted; and

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words "one hundred crores” the words "five hundred crores"
shall be substituted.

The above translation of FoF 3 sdmaérieﬁ (?uz‘)UZ,Sé) (3DSB) eHRaD, 2015 (20158 3Zoredd woORAHmD
moa3:43) be published in the Official Gazette under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of

VAJUBHAI VALA
GOVERNOR OF EARNATAKA

By Order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka

S.B. GUNJIGAVI
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs

TTee0 shudememab, axem TG Zus, dorisech, (&B) 400 Tatih)



